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a) Admission Criteria  
 
 

    Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Architecture 

 

B.Arch (Full Time) 50% aggregate marks in 10 
+2 or a pass in 10+3 Diploma 
or IB Diploma with 40% 
marks in NATA 
For SC/ST candidates with 
not less than 45% marks in 
aggregate with 40% marks in 
NATA 
 

5 Years 

Ph.D  Architecture  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs 

 
Department of Civil Engineering 

 

B.E Civil Engineering  
(Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.   
 

4 Years 

Periyar Nagar, Vallam Thanjavur - 613 403, Tamil Nadu, India.  
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Course Eligibility Duration 

B.E Civil Engineering  
(Lateral Entry) (Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                      (or) 
A pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate.  
 

3 Years 

B.E Civil Engineering (Part 
Time) 

A pass in the respective 
Diploma in Engg./Tech. Of 
the State Board of Technical 
Education and Training, Tamil 
Nadu or any other equivalent 
with minimum 2 years of 
relevant experience in public 
or private sectors 
 

3½   Years 

ME. Construction Engineering 
and Management (Full Time) 

B.E./B.Tech. Civil  (or) 
B.Arch or equivalent  
 

2 Years 

ME. Construction Engineering 
and Management (Week End) 

B.E./B.Tech. Civil  (or) 
B.Arch or equivalent  
 

3 Years 

Ph.D Civil Engineering  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs 
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Department of Computer Science & Engineering 

B.E Computer Science and 
Engineering (Full Time)  

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.   

4 Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

B.E Computer Science and 
Engineering (Lateral Entry)   
(Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                     (or) 
A  pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate.  
 

3  Years 

M.E Computer Science & 
Engineering (Full Time) 

B.E / B.Tech ( EEE / ECE 
/E&I / I&C / Electronics / 
Instrumentation / CSE/IT) or 
MCA or equivalent 
   

2 Years 

M.E Computer Science & 
Engineering (Week End) 

B.E / B.Tech ( EEE / ECE 
/E&I / I&C / Electronics / 
Instrumentation / CSE/IT) or 
MCA or equivalent 
   

3 Years 

Ph.D Computer Science and 
Engineering  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

B.E Electronics and 
Communication Engineering   
(Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.  
  

4 Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Electronics & Communication Engineering 

 

B.E Electronics and 
Communication Engineering  
(Lateral Entry) (Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                        (or) 
A  pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate  
 

3 Years 

B.E Electronics and 
Communication Engineering   
(Part Time) 

A pass in the respective 
Diploma in Engg./Tech. Of 
the State Board of Technical 
Education and Training, Tamil 
Nadu or any other equivalent 
with minimum 2 years of 
relevant experience in public 
or private sectors 
 

3½   Years 

M.Tech Nano Technology  
(Full Time) 
 

B.E / B.Tech Electronics, 
EEE, Mechanical, 
Biotechnology, Chemical or 
equivalent or M.Sc, with 
Physics, Mathematics, 
Chemistry, Biochemistry or 
equivalent 
 

2 Years 

Ph.D Electronics & 
Communication Engg. (Full 
Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  
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Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Electrical & Electronics Engineering 

 

B.E. Electrical & Electronics 
Engineering (Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.   
 

4 Years 

B.E. Electrical & Electronics  
Engineering (Lateral Entry)   
(Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 

                       (or) 

A pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate  

 

3 Years 

 
Department of Electrical & Electronics Engineering 

 

B.E. Electrical & Electronics 
Engineering (Part Time) 

A pass in the respective 
Diploma in Engg./Tech. Of 
the State Board of Technical 
Education and Training, Tamil 
Nadu or any other equivalent 
with minimum 2 years of 
relevant experience in public 
or private sectors. 
 

3½ Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

M.E Power Electronics & 
Drives (Week End) 

B.E / B.Tech ( EEE / ECE 
/E&I / I&C / Electronics / 
Instrumentation) or 
equivalent. 
   

3 Years 

 
Department of Mechanical Engineering 

 

B.E Mechanical Engineering  
(Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.  
  

4 Years 

B.E Mechanical Engineering 
(Lateral Entry)  (Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                     (or) 
A pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate  
 

3 Years 

B.E Mechanical Engineering  
(Part Time) 

A pass in the respective 
Diploma in Engg./Tech. Of 
the State Board of Technical 
Education and Training, Tamil 
Nadu or any other equivalent 
with minimum 2 years of 
relevant experience in public 
or private sectors. 
 

3½ Years 

M.Tech Renewable Energy  
(Week End) 

B.E / B.Tech (Mech. 
Chemical/ Biotech/ Electro 
Chemical/ Electrical) or 
equivalent. 
 

3 Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

Ph.D Mechanical Engg  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

 
Department of Bio Technology 

 

B.Tech. Bio-Technology  
(Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
with Physics, Chemistry and 
Biology. 
  

4 Years 

M.Phil Bio Technology (Full 
Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

1 Year 

Ph.D. Bio-Technology   
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs 

Ph.D Pharmacy  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  
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Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Information Technology 

 

B.Tech. Information 
Technology (Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
or a pass in HSC (Vocational 
Stream) with Engineering / 
Technology vocational 
subject with Mathematics as 
compulsory subject and any 
ONE or TWO of related 
subject like Physics, 
Computer Science or 
Chemistry with minimum 
marks in the relevant 
subjects.  
  

4 Years 

B.Tech. Information 
Technology (Lateral Entry) 
(Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                       (or) 
A pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate  
 

3 Years 

 
Department of Petro Chemical Technology 

 

B.Tech Petro Chemical 
Technology 
(Full Time) 

A pass in 10 +2 examination 
with Physics, Chemistry and 
Biology. 
 

4 Years 

B.Tech Petro Chemical 
Technology 
 (Lateral Entry) (Full Time) 

A pass in relevant Diploma in 
Engineering / Technology 
with 60 percentage of Marks 
in aggregate. 
                       (or) 
A pass in the B.Sc Degree 
with mathematics as a subject 
and with a minimum of 60 
percent in aggregate  
 

3 Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Management Studies 

 

M.B.A (Dual Electives) (Full 
Time) 

A pass in any bachelor 
degree 

2 Years 

M.B.A International 
Management (Full Time) 

A pass in any bachelor 
degree 

2 Years 

Ph.D Management Studies  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

 
Department of Computer Applications 

 

M.C.A (Full Time) Any Degree with mathematics 
as a subject in HSC Level or 
any degree with mathematics 
as a subject or equivalent. 
 

3 Years 

M.Phil Computer Science  
(Full Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

1 Year 

Ph.D Computer Science and 
Applications  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

 
Department of Software Engineering 

 

M.Sc. Software Engineering 
(Integrated) (Full Time) 

A pass in HSC /Diploma from 
Tamil Nadu Govt. or 
equivalent. 
 
 

5 Years 
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Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Department of Humanities, Sciences & Management 

 

M.Sc. Clinical Research  
(Full Time) 
 

Any graduate with First Class 
or equivalent grades in B.Sc.-
Chemistry, Bio Chemistry, 
Microbiology, Home Science, 
Zoology, Food & Nutrition, 
MLT,B.Pharm,/MBBS/BDS/B.
Sc.Nursing, Bio-Technology, 
Bio-Science or physiology or 
physiotherapy or any 
equivalent Degree of any 
recognized University. 
 

2 Years 

M.Phil Maths (Full Time) 
 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

1 Year 

M.Phil Physics (Full Time) 
 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

1 Year 

 
Department of Humanities, Sciences & Management 

 

Ph.D English   
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

Ph.D Mathematics  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  
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Course Eligibility Duration 

Ph.D Chemistry  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

Ph.D Physical Education  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

Ph.D Library and Information 
Science (Full Time & Part 
Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  

 
Department of Education 

 

B.Ed – Tamil, English, Maths, 
Computer Science, Physical 
Science, Biological Science, 
History, Geography, 
Commerce, Economics, 
Home Science, Social 
Science 

The candidate should have 
undergone 10+2+3 pattern 
(Passed X and XII Std 
examinations) or 11+1+3 
pattern (Passed SSLC and 
PUC) of study and UG 
Degree examinations of the 
UGC approved Universities in 
any one of the school 
subjects offered by the 
Directorate of School 
Education at the Secondary / 
Higher Secondary Education 
level.  

1 Year 



 13 

 

Course Eligibility Duration 

 
Centre for Rural Development 

 

M.S.W- Master of Social 
Work (Integrated)  (Full Time) 

HSC or equivalent 5 Years 

M.S.W- Master of Social 
Work (Lateral Entry) (Full 
Time) 

Any bachelor degree  2 Years 

M.Phil Social Work Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

1 Year 

 
Dr.Kalaignar M.Karunanidhi Centre for Political Science  

 

M.A Political Science  
(Integrated) (Full Time) 

HSC or equivalent 5 Years 

Ph.D Political Science  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs 

 
Centre for Periyar Thought 

 

Ph.D Periyar Thought  
(Full Time & Part Time) 

Good academic performance 
in the relevant PG 
programme. 
 

Full Time  
Minimum 2 Yrs 
Maximum 6 Yrs 
 
Part-Time 
Minimum 3 Yrs 
Maximum 7 Yrs  
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Periyar Maniammai University Entrance Test (PMUET): 
 
The Entrance Test will be conducted in various centers throughout India for both UG & 

PG Engineering Courses based on the previous level of educational qualification. 

 
A merit list will be prepared based on the total marks of 300 (200 marks of qualify 

examination & 100 marks of PMUET) 

 
In case more than one candidate get the same marks in the common merit list such 

candidates shall be determined in the order of priority as specified below. 

1. Percentage of marks in Maths 
2. Percentage of marks in Physics 
3. Date of Birth 
4. Random Number assigned. 

 
The overall rank and community wise rank list will be published in the website of PMU 

(www.pmu.edu) No separate announcement will be made in the newspapers. 

Reservation: As per the norms of MHRD, Govt. of India. 
 
 

http://www.pmu.edu/


 15 

b) Process of Admission 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                                
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

No 

Admission Co-ordinator 

Sale of Application Forms 

Preparation of information 

Brochure and advertisement 

Receiving the filled in  

Application Forms 

Scrutinizing the Application 

Continual 

improvement 

Rules & Regulations of 

UGC, AICTE, COA,  

NCTE & PMU 

University  

Conducting online / offline 

entrance examination 

Is the 

applicant 

Eligible? 

 

Rejected 

 

Archives 

 

Not responded 

candidates 
Feedback 

from the 

parents 

regarding 

the 

admission 

process 

Selection on the basis of merit 

and Availability of seats & 

intimation for Counselling 

Yes 

Entry into the department 

Publication of Admission list 

 with the approval of VC 
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c. Admission for NRI / PIO 
 

Candidates studying in India or abroad may apply for admissions under NRI /PIO / 

Children of Indian Workers in Gulf countries / Foreign National Category, adhering to the 

rules and regulations of the Government of India with the following eligibility criteria. 

 

1. Pass in 12th Standard or equivalent with Physics and Mathematics as compulsory 

subjects  along with one of the following subjects:  

 “Chemistry / Bio-Technology / Computer Science / Biology or equivalent” 

2. There is no entrance test for NRI / PIO / Children of Indian Workers in Gulf 

countries /  Foreign National Category.     

3.  Applicants for Admissions under NRI quota shall not have completed 21 years of 

age as on  the 1st July of the respective academic year. 

4. NRI financially supporting the candidates must be blood relation such as his/her 

Father,  Mother, Sister, Brother, Uncle, (Father’s brother or Mother’s brother) and 

Aunt (Mother’s  Sister of Father’s Sister) only, residing abroad. 

 

The candidates should be furnished the following documents at the time of Admission 
 
      NRI Category 
 
 
 Sponsorship Letter. 

 Relationship Certificate in Original (blood relation must be Father, Mother, Sister, 

Brother, Uncle and Aunty only). 

 Letters from the employer’s sponsor in original.  

 Statement of Bank A/C of sponsor with NRI A/C number. 

 NRI Status certificate of financial supporter issued by the embassy of respective 

country under their seal in original. 

 Nativity certificate of the sponsor. 

 Mark sheets of the qualifying examination. 

 Transfer certificate. 
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Foreign National Category 

 

 Valid Passport. 

 Valid Visa / PIO Card / Citizenship Card / Refugee Cards. 

 Recent NOC from police Administration / Certificate from Tahsildar. 

 Proof of having studied the required qualifying subjects in English medium. 

 Equivalency certificate from concerned embassy of the country, where the student 

studied. 

 Mark sheets of the qualifying examination. 

 Transfer certificate. 

 Migration Certificate. 

   
 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 
 


